
Kerala Gazetted No 23 dated 8th March 1982
PART I

GOVERNMENT OF KERALA
Abstract

RULES – KERALA SERVICE RULES – AMENDMENT TO THE MODEL
FORM OF AGREEMENT IN APPENDIX – I ISSUED

========================================================================
FINANCE (RULES) DEPARTMENT

G.O. (P) 199/82/Fin  Dated, Trivandrum, 24th April 1982
========================================================================
Read:- Letter No. Co – ord. II/12-28/Appx.238 dated 24-3-1982 from the Accountant General,
Kerala

NOTIFICATION

S.R.O.No. 712/82- In exercise of the power conferred by subsection (1) of section 2 of the
Kerala Public Service Act, 1968 (19 of 1968)  read with section 3 thereof, the Government of Kerala
hereby make the following rules further to amend the Kerala Service Rules, namely:-

Rules

1.      (i) These rules may be called the Kerala Service (Amendment) Rules,    1982.

(ii) They shall come into force at once

2. In the Kerala Service Rules, in the model form of agreement in Appendix I in clause 3, -

(a) in sub clause (2)-

(i) ‘for the words ‘three calendar months’, the words “two calendar
months” shall be substituted.

(ii) The following proviso shall be inserted. Namely:-
“Provided that the Government may in lieu of any notice nerve provided for, given the party of

the first part, a sum equivalent to the amount of his pay if two months or shorter notice than two
months, if they pay him a sum equal to the amount of his pay for the period by which such notice falls
short of two months”

(b) in sub- clause (5),

(i) for the words “six calendar months”, the words “two calendar months”
shall be substituted;

(ii) for the words “six months” wherever they occur in the first proviso,
the words “two months” shall be substituted.

(iii) The second proviso shall be omitted.

By order of the Governor,

G.JEOTHI
Additional Secretary



Explanatory Note

(This does not form art of the notification, but is intended to indicate its general purport)

As per the model form of agreement in Appendix I Kerala Service Rules, the Service of person
appointed on contract basis can be terminated without notice at the end of the first year, on medical
grounds, on grounds of insubordination, miscount etc. Three months notice is required for termination
at any time after the firs year, if the Office is fund unsuitable for efficient discharge of duties and six
months’ notice for termination without cause assigned. Government have examined the question of
reducing the period or three months and six months in the above cases and have decided to reduce the
term to two months in both cases. Hence the above amendment is issued.

To

The Accountant General, Kerala, Trivandrum.
All Heads of Departments and Offices.
All Departments sections of the Secretariat.
The Registrar, High Court Ernakulam ( with C.L)
The Registrar, University of Kerala, Cochin, Calicut ( with C.L)
The Registrar, Kerala Agricultural University , Trichur ( with C.L)
The Secretary Kerala Public Service Commission ( with C.L)
The Secretary, Kerala State Electricity Board Trivandrum (with C.L)
The General Manager, Kerala State Road Transport Corporation, Trivandrum
The Secretaries, Additional Secretaries, Joint Secretaries, Deputy Secretaries and Under
Secretaries to Government
The Private Secretaries to the Chief Minister and other Ministers
The Secretary to Governor.


